

**Detailed Bid Tab for ITB# 4580 - Granular Activated Carbon (GAC)**

Description	UoM	Calgon Carbon		Carbon Activated		Cabot	
		Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price
<b>Virgin GAC - Effective size 0.8 to 1.0 mm</b>							
Granular Activated Carbon Bulk	CF	\$ 32.70		\$ 39.80		\$ 43.79	
Freight		\$ 8.67		\$ 2.00		included	
Total Delivered Cost			\$ 41.37		\$ 41.80		\$ 43.79
<b>Reactivated GAC - Effective size 0.8 to 1.0 mm</b>							
Granular Activated Carbon Bulk	CF	\$ 19.13		\$ 20.40		No Bid	
Freight		\$ 6.67		\$ 2.00		No Bid	
Total Delivered Cost			\$ 25.80		\$ 22.40		No Bid
<b>Virgin GAC - Effective size 0.55 to 0.75 mm</b>							
Granular Activated Carbon Bulk	CF	\$ 38.26		\$ 41.20		\$ 45.82	
Freight		\$ 8.67		\$ 2.00		included	
Total Delivered Cost			\$ 46.93		\$ 43.20		\$ 45.82
<b>Reactivated GAC - Effective size 0.55 to 0.75 mm</b>							
Granular Activated Carbon Bulk	CF	\$ 18.67		\$ 20.90		No Bid	
Freight		\$ 6.67		\$ 2.00		No Bid	
Total Delivered Cost			\$ 25.34		\$ 22.90		No Bid
<b>TOTAL</b>			<b>\$ 114.10</b>		<b>\$ 107.40</b>		<b>\$ 89.61</b>

\*Note that Cabot did not provide pricing on all items requested.