
Item # Item Description Quantity Unit Unit Price *

Base Bid – ABB AquaMaster 3 SW CONTROL

1 5/8” Magnetic Water Meter TBD EA $1,995.00

2 3/4” Magnetic Water Meter TBD EA $1,995.00

3 1” Magnetic Water Meter TBD EA $1,995.00

4 1-1/2” Magnetic Water Meter TBD EA $2,145.00

5 2” Magnetic Water Meter TBD EA $2,245.00

6 2-1/2” Magnetic Water Meter TBD EA $2,500.00

7 3” Magnetic Water Meter TBD EA $2,295.00

8 4” Magnetic Water Meter TBD EA $2,600.00

9 6” Magnetic Water Meter TBD EA $2,800.00

10 8” Magnetic Water Meter TBD EA $3,492.00

11 10” Magnetic Water Meter TBD EA $3,800.00

12 12” Magnetic Water Meter TBD EA $4,392.00

13 External Battery Pack TBD EA $775.00

14 Programming Cable TBD EA $295.00

15 Spare Display Converter TBD EA $1,095.00

16 Connection Conversion Kit TBD EA $825.00

Item # Item Description Quantity Unit Unit Price *

Alternate Bid – Alternate Manufacturers (Section 02620)  Name BADGER ETNA MASTER METER

1 5/8” Magnetic Water Meter TBD EA $108.04 $125.00 $98.00

2 3/4” Magnetic Water Meter TBD EA $121.36 $150.00 $129.00

3 1” Magnetic Water Meter TBD EA $143.56 $195.00 $148.00

4 1-1/2” Magnetic Water Meter TBD EA $395.25 $3,283.00 $342.00

5 2” Magnetic Water Meter TBD EA $532.95 $3,574.00 $1,450.00

6 2-1/2” Magnetic Water Meter TBD EA NO BID NO BID $619.00

7 3” Magnetic Water Meter TBD EA $1,629.00 $3,954.00 $1,695.00

8 4” Magnetic Water Meter TBD EA $1,724.50 $4,076.00 $2,790.00

9 6” Magnetic Water Meter TBD EA $1,949.50 $4,240.00 $4,550.00

10 8” Magnetic Water Meter TBD EA $2,271.25 $5,033.00 $6,120.00

11 10” Magnetic Water Meter TBD EA $2,578.00 $5,966.00 $9,150.00

12 12” Magnetic Water Meter TBD EA $3,570.25 $7,016.00 $13,900.00

13 External Battery Pack TBD EA $124.00 $85/$150 N/A

14 Programming Cable TBD EA NO BID $0.00 $162.00

15 Spare Display Converter TBD EA $880.00 $1,350/$1,700 N/A

16 Connection Conversion Kit TBD EA NO BID $68.00


