



CITY OF ANN ARBOR

BID TABULATION SHEET

BID NUMBER: 4301 DATE: 8.2.13

BID NAME: Department Ammunition Supply

BIDDER

BID DEPOSIT ADDENDUM REC'D
(YES OR NO) (YES OR NO)

BASE BID AMOUNT

BIDDER	BID DEPOSIT (YES OR NO)	ADDENDUM REC'D (YES OR NO)	BASE BID AMOUNT
1. <u>Kieslers</u>	<u>NO</u>		
2. <u>Michigan Ammo Co.</u>	<u>Yes</u>		
3. <u>Michigan Police Equipment</u>	<u>Yes</u>		
4.		<u>See</u>	
5.		<u>Spreadsheet</u>	
6.			
7.			
8.			
9.			
10.			
11.			
12.			
13.			
14.			

BID RECORDED BY: [Signature]
(Signature)

ITB-4301 Police Department Ammunition Supply

Prices are per 1000

	Kiesler's	Mich Ammo Co.	Mich Police Equip
Speer Gold Dot .40 180 grain	\$404.28	No Bid	\$320.00
Speer Gold Dot 9mm 147 grain	\$375.60	No Bid	\$338.00
Fed bonded .223 bonded (LE223T3) 62 grain	\$1,260.00	No Bid	\$650.00
.223 FMJ or TMJ 62 grain (training ammo)	\$409.56	No Bid	\$298.00
Match grade wad cutter .38 148 grain	\$288.00	No Bid	\$245.00
Match grade semi-wad cutter .45 185 grain	\$379.50	No Bid	\$350.00
Reload Ammo			
.40 180 grain FMJ or TMJ (training ammo)	\$264.50	\$205.00	\$200.00
9mm 147 grain FMJ or TMJ (training ammo)	\$204.67	\$195.00	\$237.00
.38 158 grain FMJ or TMJ (training ammo)	\$306.08	\$200.00	\$230.00
.45 185 grain semi-wad cutter (training ammo)	\$379.50	\$325.00	\$350.00
.38 148 grain was cutter (training ammo)	\$288.00	\$230.00	\$245.00