

		RNA Facilities Management		Evergreen Maintenance		U.S. Lawns of Ann Arbor		KBK Landscaping	
	# of Cuts	Cost Per Cut	Season Total	Cost Per Cut	Season Total	Cost Per Cut	Season Total	Cost Per Cut	Season Total
A. City Traffic Islands									
City Traffic Islands	29	\$ 2,195.00	\$ 63,655.00	\$ 1,974.00	\$ 57,246.00	\$ 3,375.00	\$ 97,875.00	No Bid	
Trunkline City Traffic Islands	29	\$ 340.00	\$ 9,860.00	\$ 270.82	\$ 7,853.78	\$ 450.00	\$ 13,050.00	No Bid	
A. Totals			\$ 73,515.00		\$ 65,099.78		\$ 110,925.00		\$ -
B. Wastewater Treatment Plant									
Mowing	29	\$ 380.00	\$ 11,020.00	\$ 340.00	\$ 9,860.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 7,250.00	No Bid	
Entrance Drive	3	\$ 525.00	\$ 1,575.00	\$ 115.00	\$ 345.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 360.00	No Bid	
B. Totals			\$ 12,595.00		\$ 10,205.00		\$ 7,610.00		\$ -
C. Other City Properties									
1510 Stadium	14	\$ 42.00	\$ 588.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 350.00	\$ 30.00	\$ 420.00	No Bid	
721 N. Main St.	14	\$ 285.00	\$ 3,990.00	\$ 327.00	\$ 4,578.00	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,310.00	No Bid	
926 Mary St.								No Bid	
3442 Platt Rd.								No Bid	
C. Totals			\$ 4,578.00		\$ 4,928.00		\$ 2,730.00		\$ -
D. Public Works Other Properties									
406 Maple Ridge St./Vacant Lot	14	\$ 45.00	\$ 630.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 350.00	\$ 30.00	\$ 420.00	No Bid	
875 S. Maple	14	\$ 70.00	\$ 980.00	\$ 127.50	\$ 1,785.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 560.00	No Bid	
Washtenaw Bike Path	14	\$ 100.00	\$ 1,400.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 2,100.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 2,100.00	No Bid	
D. Totals			\$ 3,010.00		\$ 4,235.00		\$ 3,080.00		\$ -
E. Landscaping Services									
Washtenaw Stadium Split/Monthly	6	\$ 200.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 145.00	\$ 870.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 1,800.00	No Bid	
Wheeler Service Center	6	\$ 325.00	\$ 1,950.00	\$ 145.00	\$ 870.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 1,350.00	No Bid	
Additional Locations Per Hour		\$ 70.00	\$ -	\$ 94.00	\$ -	\$ 75.00	\$ -	No Bid	
E. Totals			\$ 3,150.00		\$ 1,740.00		\$ 3,150.00		\$ -
F. Right Of Way Mowing and Brush Clearing									
Huron River Drive	2	\$ 2,850.00	\$ 5,700.00	\$ 5,800.00	\$ 11,600.00	\$ 800.00	\$ 1,600.00	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 3,000.00
Pontiac Trail	2	\$ 350.00	\$ 700.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 600.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 600.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 1,500.00
Plymouth Rd	2	\$ 585.00	\$ 1,170.00	\$ 1,800.00	\$ 3,600.00	\$ 450.00	\$ 900.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 1,500.00
Fuller - Fuller Ct. to Furstenberg	2	\$ 1,350.00	\$ 2,700.00	\$ 2,900.00	\$ 5,800.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 800.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 2,000.00
Fuller - N. State to Glen Ct.	2	\$ 400.00	\$ 800.00	\$ 2,300.00	\$ 4,600.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 450.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 1,500.00
Glazier Way - Wolverhampton to Green	2	\$ 2,250.00	\$ 4,500.00	\$ 1,800.00	\$ 3,600.00	\$ 350.00	\$ 700.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 2,000.00
Glazier Way - Huron Pkwy to Fuller	2	\$ 1,750.00	\$ 3,500.00	\$ 2,100.00	\$ 4,200.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 800.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 2,000.00
F. Totals			\$ 19,070.00		\$ 34,000.00		\$ 5,850.00		\$ 13,500.00
			<u>\$ 115,918.00</u>		<u>\$ 120,207.78</u>		<u>\$ 133,345.00</u>		<u>\$ -</u>

* Figure in red notes incorrect math on bid form.